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Southeast Asia, a vibrant and diverse region, has witnessed the emergence
of regional identity amidst the intricate tapestry of national identities.
Education, particularly through schools, plays a pivotal role in shaping and
transmitting this regional consciousness. This book, "Regional Identity,
Schools, and Politics in Southeast Asia," delves into the complex
intersections of regional identity, education, and politics in this fascinating
region.

Drawing on extensive research and case studies, the book illuminates the
ways in which schools contribute to the construction, contestation, and
negotiation of regional identity. Through curriculum, textbooks, and
pedagogical practices, schools become conduits for transmitting regional
knowledge, values, and aspirations. However, this process is not always
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straightforward, as schools also grapple with the challenges of reconciling
regional and national identities.

The Role of Schools in Shaping Regional Identity

Schools are not simply neutral institutions that impart knowledge and skills.
They are also active agents in the socialization of individuals, shaping their
worldviews and identities. In Southeast Asia, schools have played a
significant role in fostering a sense of regional identity among students.

Through the curriculum, students learn about the history, culture, and
geography of the region. Textbooks often emphasize the shared
experiences and commonalities among Southeast Asian nations, promoting
a sense of belonging to a broader regional community. Extracurricular
activities, such as regional exchanges and cultural performances, further
reinforce this regional consciousness.

Moreover, schools provide opportunities for students to interact with peers
from other Southeast Asian countries. Through these interactions, students
develop friendships and build networks that transcend national boundaries.
These experiences contribute to the formation of a shared regional identity
that goes beyond the confines of the classroom.

The Politics of Regional Identity

The promotion of regional identity in schools is not without its political
implications. Governments in Southeast Asia have often sought to harness
the power of education to advance their own political agendas.

Some governments have used schools to promote a particular version of
regional identity that aligns with their national interests. For example, in



Thailand, the government has emphasized the role of Buddhism in Thai
identity and has incorporated Buddhist teachings into the school
curriculum. This has contributed to the construction of a regional identity
that is centered on Thailand's own cultural and historical heritage.

Other governments have used schools to promote regional cooperation
and integration. For instance, the Association of Southeast Asian Nations
(ASEAN) has developed educational initiatives that aim to foster a sense of
regional unity among its member states. These initiatives include student
exchanges, scholarships, and curriculum development projects.

Regionalism and National Identity

The emergence of regional identity in Southeast Asia has raised questions
about its relationship with national identity. Some scholars have argued that
regional identity poses a challenge to national identity, as it may lead to a
weakening of national loyalties and a sense of belonging to a broader
regional community.

However, other scholars contend that regional identity and national identity
are not mutually exclusive. They argue that it is possible for individuals to
have multiple identities that are both regional and national. In Southeast
Asia, many people identify themselves as both citizens of their own country
and as part of a broader Southeast Asian community.

"Regional Identity, Schools, and Politics in Southeast Asia" provides a
comprehensive analysis of the multifaceted relationship between regional
identity, schools, and politics in this dynamic region. The book
demonstrates that schools play a crucial role in shaping regional



consciousness, while also being influenced by the political context in which
they operate.

Furthermore, the book highlights the complex relationship between regional
identity and national identity. It argues that these identities are not
necessarily contradictory, but rather can coexist and complement each
other. By understanding the interplay of these forces, we can gain a deeper
appreciation for the complexities of identity formation in Southeast Asia and
its implications for regional and international relations.
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